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1. General

Welcome to Flourish and thank you for using our services!

Flourish is Smart Employee Growth Assistant that helps companies by developing
emotional intelligence in an affordable and effective way. We are available at
our website https://flourishapp.me (“Site”). Use of this Site and access to the
services, customer software is covered by these terms and conditions of service
("Terms").

By accepting these Terms of Service, it forms a legally binding Software as a
Service (SaaS) contract between Client and Flourish.

By using our services you represent and warrant that:

● you’re agreeing to be bound to these Terms,
● you’re at least 18 years old,
● if you are using our Services on behalf of an organization, you are agreeing

on these Terms on behalf of that organization and warrant that you are
authorized to bind yourself and the represented organization.

Note: We recommend printing a copy of these Terms or saving them to your
computer for future reference!

Flourish provides Internet-based document storage and is available at our
website www.flourishapp.me (“Website”). Use services, customer software and
websites („Services“) conditions of service ("Terms").

Please read these Terms carefully before starting using our Services. Once
accepted they form a legally binding contract (“Contract”) between you and
Flourish (“Flourish”, “we”, “us” or “our”), a private limited company registered in the
Republic of Montenegro, with company Social security number/PIB 03407101 and
with the registered address at Buvelar S. Petra Cetinjskog 114, Podgorica,
Montenegro.

Please also carefully read our Privacy Notice, which explains how your
information is collected, used, shared and disclosed as well as what are your
rights as a data subject. Privacy Notice also includes our Cookie Policy.

By using our Services (including by registering for an account, by clicking the
“submit”, “accept” or “continue” buttons, by signing or otherwise indicating the
acceptance of these Terms) you represent and warrant that:

● you’re agreeing to be bound to these Terms,
● you’re at least 18 years old,
● you have read our Privacy Notice and agree to processing your personal

https://flourishapp.me


data as described in our Privacy Notice,
● if you are using our Services on behalf of an organization, you are agreeing

on these Terms on behalf of that organization and warrant that you are
authorized to bind yourself and the represented organization.

Please note, that to the maximum extent permitted by applicable law, we provide
only limited warranties and limit our liability as provided in Sections 12 and 13 of
these Terms.

We recommend printing a copy of these Terms or saving them to your computer
for future reference!

2. Registration and user accounts

To use our Services, you are required to create a user account with Flourish
(“Account”) by completing and submitting a registration form on our website. You
must provide current, complete and accurate information about yourself as
prompted by the registration form and update this information as needed to keep
it current, complete and accurate.

To use our services, you are required to create a user account with Flourish
(“Account”) by completing and submitting a registration form on our Site. You
must provide current, complete and accurate information about yourself, and
your company as prompted by the registration form and update this information
as needed to keep it current, complete and accurate.

Our Services allow you to create an account, corresponding to your e-mail
address. After creating a User Account, you can create as many subaccounts as
you need and share the access and usage of these accounts to other users of
Flourish. In that case your User Account shall serve as a main account (“Tenant
Account”) and the accounts you have created under your User Account shall
serve as subaccounts (“Subaccounts”). You shall be the manager of all
Subaccounts that you have created. You as a Tenant Account owner are fully
responsible for all activities made under Subaccounts and liable for any damages
arising from such activities, whether or not you have authorized them. All fees in
connection with Subaccounts shall be paid by the Main Account owner and billed
accordingly.

Our Services allow you to create a User Account, corresponding to your email
address. After creating a User Account you can create as many subaccounts as



you need and share the access and usage of these accounts to other users of
Flourish (e.g. to your employees, who have a valid User Account in Flourish). In
that case your User Account shall serve as a main account (“Main Account'') and
the accounts you have created under your User Account shall serve as
subaccounts (“Subaccounts”). You shall be the manager of all Subaccounts that
you have created. You as a Main Account owner are fully responsible for all
activities made under Subaccounts and liable for any damages arising from such
activities, whether or not you have authorized them. All fees in connection with
Subaccounts shall be paid by the Main Account owner and billed accordingly.

Please note that if your employer or any other party has created a user account
for you, that party has rights to your account, including the right to manage your
account, change your password, change or close your account, look at your
account’s usage data; also to access, read, share etc. the whole content stored in
your account, also to grant other users the right to do the same.

Subaccount user shall, additionally to these Terms, obey also to the lawful rules,
procedures and instructions etc. that may arise from your relations with the Main
Account owner.

3. Account security

You will receive a password upon completing the registration process. We may
also accept other identification means to safely access and use our services as
provided on our Site (e.g. ID-card, Mobile-ID etc). Please safeguard your Account
password or any other identification means and ensure that you exit from your
Account at the end of each session.

Upon completing the registration process, you will receive a mail, with a link to
verify your account and create password. Please safeguard your Account
password or any other identification means and ensure that you exit from your
Account at the end of each session.

You are solely responsible for maintaining the confidentiality of the password and
the Account. Also you are fully responsible for all activities that occur under your
password or Account, whether or not you actually authorized that activity. You
yourself are responsible for taking any other measures to additionally secure your
Account, its content and transmission of your data (e.g. encrypting your data and
using secure encrypted connection to communicate with the Services).

You should notify us immediately of any unauthorized use of your password or



Account or any other breach of security that is known or suspected by you. We
take no liability for any loss or damage arising from any unauthorized use of your
Account

We take no liability for any loss or damage arising from any unauthorized use of
your Account.

4. User conduct and acceptable use

You are responsible for your conduct and the content of any files and folders you
upload, create, share or store in your Account. You agree to comply with all
applicable laws, rules and regulations, including Montenegrin and international
laws, rules and regulations.

You shall use the website and our Services with good faith and respecting the
rights of Flourish, other users or any other persons. It is forbidden to use our Site
and Services for illegal or immoral activities or purposes, including but not limited
to the infringement of any intellectual property right, the unauthorized transfer to
you and impersonation or misrepresentation, threatening or harassing another
person, but also using our Services to develop a similar website or service.

You must not harm the Services or the website in any way, e.g. disable,
overburden or impair the Services. You promise not to transmit through post,
distribute or otherwise make available any software or other computer files that
contain viruses, spyware or any other harmful or deleterious computer code, files
or programs such as Trojan horses, worm or other harmful or destructive
components.

You are not allowed to transfer your rights regarding the Services to any other
person, neither fully nor partly.

You must not use the Services in connection with the activities in which the failure
of the Services could cause death, personal injury, environmental damage or
damage to the physical property.

5. Your uploaded files and back-up

In the course of using our Services you submit to us files, contacts, email
messages, folders etc. ("Files"). You retain all rights and full ownership of any
ownership/intellectual property rights that you hold in the content of your Files.

These Terms don't give us any rights to your Files; however, we may access your



Account and Files to respond to the problems regarding the Services or for solving
any technical issue related to the Service. We may grant the same right to the
trusted third parties we work with in order to provide the Services (hosting
services).

We will not monitor or disclose the information regarding your Account or Files
without your prior permission unless this is required by applicable law.

Please bear in mind that your Files’ content may be protected by intellectual
property rights that belong to another person. Please make sure that you do not
copy, upload, download, share or use the Files in any other way, unless you have
the right to do so.

You agree and understand that you are solely responsible for the accuracy,
quality, integrity, legality, reliability and appropriateness as well as copyright of all
your Files.

We reserve the right to remove or restrict access to the Files or information, in
case we have received information that these Files or information is a subject of
possible breach of the Contract or violation of law or third party rights (e.g. when
we receive a notice about the breach of copyright). We bear no responsibility or
liability for removing the Files or making them inaccessible. It’s your responsibility
to solve any legal issues with any third parties before we can restore your access
to the Files or information in question.

We recommend taking appropriate measures to back-up and restore your Files
as you consider necessary. Flourish provides Service tools to assist you with the
back-up activities; however Flourish cannot take responsibility for your Files and
will not be liable for any loss or corruption of your Files or for failure to access, to
upload, to back-up or restore your Files; also for any costs or expenses associated
with backing up or restoring the Files.

It is our right to determine the acceptable file types within our Services and
restrict you from uploading certain types of files to your Account.

6. Intellectual property rights and licenses

All rights, including intellectual property rights, with respect to the Services and
hardware, software and any other means for providing the Services, belong to
Flourish, except the rights that we have explicitly delegated to you according
these Terms.



Flourish hereby grants that during the Service Contract’s validity, the Client a
non-exclusive, non-transferable, limited license to use Platform’s functionality
according to the license type solely for the intended purpose and for internal
needs, in compliance with the Contract. The Client shall not share data or the
Content from the Flourish products with Flourish competitors.

Flourish owns all intellectual property rights related to the Platform, Web Site and
its services, including any and all software, tools, specifications, guidelines,
domains, trademarks, business names and instructions provided by Flourish to
the Client. Client shall have no rights under this Terms of Service in or to the
Flourish trademarks, and shall not, during the term, represent that it is the owner
or licensee of the Flourish trademarks.

The Client owns all intellectual property rights related to the data and documents
(Client’s Content) provided to and/or through the Platform. Flourish shall not use
Client’s intellectual property rights for its own business operations or make Client’s
intellectual property rights available in any manner to any third party for use in
the third party’s business operations, other than expressly permitted in this Service
Contract and/or separately agreed with the Client for further partnerships.

Web Site might contain references or links to third party websites. Flourish does
not control the linked sites in any way, nor does Flourish monitor or check the
linked sites. Flourish is not liable for the contents, correctness, reliability or data
security of the linked sites.

Software for using our Services is made available to you on a license basis. You
shall not receive ownership of the Software. Your rights to use the software end
together with the end of rights to use the Service; in that case you must de-install
the software or we will make it unavailable to you.

We reserve the right to upload automatic software updates to your device that
you use for using our Services.

You hereby grant to Flourish a free, global, exclusive and termless license
regarding the changes that we have implemented on the basis of your feedback
to us about our Services, website etc.



7. Fees and payments

Fees

Although many of our Services are free of charge, we apply reasonable fees for
using some of our Services or its features (e.g. sharing Files, additional storage
space etc.). Price list with applicable fees („Fees“) and information about different
payment plans are available on our Site.

We may automatically renew your Services and charge you for a renewal term.
You can opt out of having your Services automatically renewed by notifying us
about it by e-mail at least three (3) days before the renewal date.

Trial period

We offer a 7 days free trial period for all our payable features and Services. After
the trial period expires, you can still at any time upgrade or downgrade your
Account, changing your payment plan according to your needs; however, in case
of downgrading we provide no refund for the prepaid period.

Billing

In case you have chosen a paid subscription, we'll automatically bill you from the
date you convert to a paid subscription. Payments are due to us on the date when
the invoice is posted on your Account.

You must keep your billing information current. You may change your payment
method and modify your billing information on the Site at any time. Your notice to
us will not affect charges we submit to your billing account before we reasonably
could act on your notice.

Payments

All Fees will be billed to the credit card you designate during the subscription
process. You must be the authorized user of the credit card which data you
provide for billing purposes. By providing us your credit card data you authorize us
to charge you for the Services using your credit card and for any paid feature of
the Services that you subscribe to or use while these Terms are in force.

Other payment methods are accepted only if and as provided on our Site (e.g.
on-line payments through our cooperating banks).

All payments shall be paid in Euros. You may have to incur costs for conversion



and transfer of money, applicable by your financial service provider.

Payment by card is realized in cooperation with AllSecure doo and is done in a
safe and certified way, through the AllSecure Payment Gateway, by simply
entering data from the payment card.

When entering payment card data, confidential information is transmitted via a
public network in a protected (encrypted) form using the SSL protocol, applying
the most modern methods of tokenization of sensitive data, and in accordance
with PCI-DSS standards. Data security during purchases is guaranteed by the
payment card processor. Payment card information is never available to the
merchant.

3D Secure protection for all merchants and customers - AllSecure Payment
Gateway uses the highest global standards of data protection and privacy. All
merchants who use the AllSecure Payment Gateway are automatically included in
3D-Secure protection, which guarantees the security of purchases to customers.
Customers' payment card numbers are not stored on the merchant's system, and
the registration itself is protected by SSL data encryption.

PCI DSS Standards - AllSecure Payment Gateway constantly complies with all
requirements of card organizations in order to increase the security level of
merchants and customers. From 2005 to today, without interruption, the system
has been certified as PCI-DSS Level 1, which represents the highest standard in the
industry. PCI Data Security Standard (PCI-DSS) is a norm that defines the
necessary security measures when processing, storing and transmitting sensitive
card data. PCI Standards protect sensitive data about the cardholder during the
entire payment process: from the moment of data entry at the merchant's point of
sale, during communications between the merchant and relevant banks and card
organizations, as well as the subsequent storage of such data.

You are responsible for all applicable taxes, and we shall charge taxes when
required to do so.

In case of payment delay, you are not able to use any chargeable features of our
Services until payments in due have been fully paid.

Changes to the price list

Please note, that we may change our price list from time to time, notifying you in
advance through the Service or by e-mail. If you don’t agree with the changes,
you can stop using the Service, notifying us about it by e-mail at least three (3)
days before the changes would start to apply to you.



Changes of the price list do not affect the Services with the effective offer on a
specific price for a specific term, until the effective offer term expires; after that
your Service usage will be charged with then-current fees. In case of change of
package payments, new prices will apply to you starting from a new payment
period, unless you have notified us about your decision to downgrade or stop
using the Services in timely manner, i.e. by e-mail at least three (3) days before
the end of the current payment period.

8. Refund policy

Flourish is not obliged to refund already made prepayments.

Canceling your subscription means that you will not be charged for the next billing
cycle, but you will not receive any refunds or credits for amounts that have
already been charged due failing to cancel subscription timely.

All applicable fees shall be paid in advance for the selected period and are not
refundable, unless otherwise is explicitly provided in the Contract.

We will provide you a proportional refund of any prepayment, in case you have a
paid Account and we terminate or materially downgrade the Services without a
cause according to Section 10.

If you are a consumer and you use your right to withdraw from this Contract
according to Section 11, we will provide you a full or proportional refund as
described in Section 11.

9. Updates and changes

We reserve the right to make updates and other changes to the Services and to its
functionalities or to suspend or stop providing the Services altogether at any time.
In case we consider the changes to be significant, we will inform our users about
the changes through our website and/or via e-mail at least seven (7) business
days in advance.

We may also revise these Terms from time to time to keep up with the changes in
legislation or court practice, to improve our Services or to clarify some aspects of
our Services or these Terms, to make the Services or these Terms more
user-friendly or to follow the prescriptions of supervisory authorities, officials or
courts. The most current version of the Terms is always available on our Site. If
changes to the Terms will significantly reduce users’ rights we will notify our users



about the upcoming changes through our Site and/or via e-mail at least seven
(7) business days in advance.

If you are not happy with the modified Services or Terms, you should discontinue
the use of the Services and cancel the Service or the Contract by sending an
e-mail notice to info@flourishapp.me before the changes come into effect.

Please consider that by continuing the use the Services after the changes come
into effect, you agree to the Service changes and are bound by the revised
Terms of the Contract.

We are not liable for any loss or damage caused by our right to amend these
Terms or modify or suspend the Services.

10. Termination of the Contract

You can terminate the Contract and cancel your Account at any time, by notifying
us about it by email.

We may suspend or stop providing the Services to you at any time with or without
notice, if you have violated or we suspect that you have violated the Contract or
any other legal document provided by Flourish or any legal acts applicable to the
use of our Services, or the lawful rights of Flourish or any other person.

We may also suspend or terminate the Contract without the cause. In that case
we will notify you by e-mail at least seven (7) business days in advance. You can
retrieve your data within the notice period with the help for the back-up. For
retrieving your Files, you may apply for a prolonged access to your Files for an
additional fee, by notifying us within three (3) days following the termination.
Otherwise, any Files you have stored on your Account will not be retrievable and
Flourish will have no obligation to maintain any data stored on your Account. We
will not grant you prolonged access to your Account if the Contract was
terminated for the reason for which you are responsible.

If you have a paid Account and we terminate or materially downgrade the
Services without cause, we will provide you a refund according to our refund
policy in Section 8.

Neither party shall be liable for any damages resulting from suspension or
termination of the Services in accordance with this Section. However, termination
of the Contract does not excuse you from fulfilling all obligations incurred before
termination of the Contract.



11. Support, maintenance and development services

To communicate with customer support, the Client can write to the e-mail
info@flourishapp.me or call phone number +38267200312. Support is included
during weekdays 8 AM to 4 PM EET and is included at no extra cost unless
otherwise expressed in the Service Contract.

Flourish will strive to reply to all requests received by the client support within a
reasonable time but will not guarantee that the requests are replied to within a
certain time or that the requests receive answers satisfactory to the inquirer.

Flourish shall provide different helpful materials for the use of the Platform,
available at the Platform and the Web Site.

Flourish reserves the right to optimize and develop the Platform further. In case of
significant changes in the Platform, Flourish will send the Client a timely
notification.

If the usage of the Platform is disturbed due to a disturbance or malfunction,
Flourish will do anything reasonably possible to eliminate the disturbance or
malfunction as soon as possible, but no later than 48 hours after discovering the
error.

Flourish maintains the right to temporarily (for no longer than 30 minutes) restrict
access to the Platform if it is needed for maintenance, development or updates. In
extraordinary cases when the access restriction needs to last longer than 30
minutes, the Client will be notified in advance.

11. Consumer’s right to withdraw from the Contract

If you are a consumer in the meaning of the Consumer Rights Directive 2011/83/EU,
you may withdraw from this Contract within 14 days, starting from the date when
the Contract is formed, without giving any reason for doing so.

In case you have decided to use your right to withdraw from the Contract, please
inform us about your decision with the explicit application.

The application for withdrawal must be addressed to Flourish to the registered
address Bulevar Sv. Petra Cetinjskog 114., 81 000 Podgorica, Montenegro or sent to
our e-mail address info@flourishapp.me. You can also notify us about the
withdrawal electronically through our Site, in which case we will immediately send
you a confirmation about the receipt of your application to your email address,



which you have provided to us in the registration form.

Your withdrawal is effective if you have dispatched your withdrawal application to
us before the end of the withdrawal period, even if we receive it later.

In the event of effective withdrawal, we will close your Account and return to you
all payments that you have made to us under this Contract immediately, but no
later than within 14 days from receiving your application. If, by subscription you
have expressed your will to start using our chargeable Services within the
withdrawal period, you are required to pay for the Services until the day when you
dispatched your withdrawal application; this means that we will return only
proportional part of your payments, considering the whole subscription volume.

12. Disclaimer of Warranties

You expressly understand and agree that your use of the service and products are
at your sole risk. The services are provided by Flourish on "as is" and “as available”
basis.

We make no warranty that (i) the quality of the service, products or information
will meet your requirements or expectations.

We may provide links to other websites or resources, but we do not take any
responsibility or liability for the availability or accuracy of the linked sites or
resources. Following the links is at your sole discretion and risk.

13. Limitation of Liability

Flourish takes full liability for damages caused intentionally or due to gross
negligence by Flourish or its employees. Otherwise the liability of Flourish shall be
limited to 20 euros or the amounts paid by you to us for the past 12 months for the
services that gave raise to the claim.

However, please consider that you must not use the service in connection with the
activities in which the failure of the services could cause death, personal injury,
environmental damage or damage to the physical property. In case of doing so,
Flourish cannot be held liable for any possible losses or damages caused.

14. Force Majeure

Neither party shall be liable for any delay, interruption or failure to perform, or lost



data under these Terms due the acts beyond its reasonable control, but only for
so long as such conditions persist. Force majeure events include (i) failures of
Software or other computer programming, (ii) natural weather events, or (iii) any
other causes beyond that party's reasonable control and occurring without its
fault or negligence, including also failure of suppliers, subcontractors, and carriers.
As a condition to the claim of non-liability, the party experiencing the difficulty
must give the other prompt written notice, with full details following the
occurrence of the cause relied upon.

15. Governing law

You agree that these Terms, its interpretation and any disputes in relation to the
Contract between you and Flourish shall be governed by the laws of the Republic
of Montenegro.

In case you are a consumer, this agreement on the choice of law does not affect
your right to rely on the consumer law applicable in the jurisdiction where you
reside.

16. Resolving disputes

Before filing an official claim against Flourish, you agree to seek for a solution
informally by contacting us by email info@flourishapp.me. If a dispute is not
resolved within 15 days, you may bring a formal proceeding. We promise to act
likewise with our claims to you.

You agree that after the failure to resolve the dispute informally as described
above, all disputes, actions, claims or causes of action related to these Terms or
the Services shall be brought only in the court located in Podgorica, Montenegro
or International court in Vienna.

In case you are a consumer and do not consent to the solution proposed by
Flourish within the process of informal dispute resolution, you may also submit a
complaint (free of charge) to the extrajudicial dispute resolution unit Consumer
protection Center (https://cezap.me/), In case you are a consumer residing in EU,
you can also seek help from the European Consumer Centre of your home country
or to use an online dispute resolution (ODR) platform
http://ec.europa.eu/consumers/odr/ according to Regulation No. 524/2013 of the
European Parliament and of the Council on online dispute resolution for consumer
disputes.

You agree to bring any claim related to these Terms or the Services within one
year starting from the date you could first bring the claim. In case you are a
consumer as well as in case of intentional breach this limitation of claim expiry

https://cezap.me/
http://ec.europa.eu/consumers/odr/


period is not applicable and expiry period provided by relevant law shall be
applied instead.

18. Disclaimer of Warranties

YOU EXPRESSLY UNDERSTAND AND AGREE THAT YOUR USE OF THE SERVICE AND
PRODUCTS ARE AT YOUR SOLE RISK. THE SERVICES ARE PROVIDED BY FOLDERIT ON "AS
IS" AND “AS AVAILABLE” BASIS.

WE MAKE NO WARRANTY THAT (i) THE QUALITY OF THE SERVICE, PRODUCTS OR
INFORMATION WILL MEET YOUR REQUIREMENTS OR EXPECTATIONS; or (ii) THE SERVICE
WILL BE UNINTERRUPTED, TIMELY, SECURE OR ERROR-FREE OR ERRORS OR DEFECTS WILL
BE CORRECTED.

WE MAY PROVIDE LINKS TO OTHER WEBSITES OR RESOURCES, BUT WE DO NOT TAKE
ANY RESPONSIBILITY OR LIABILITY FOR THE AVAILABILITY OR ACCURACY OF THE LINKED
SITES OR RESOURCES. FOLLOWING THE LINKS IS AT YOUR SOLE DISCRETION AND RISK.

ANY CONTENT DOWNLOADED OR OTHERWISE OBTAINED THROUGH THE USE OF THE
SERVICE OR SOFTWARE IS ACCESSED AT YOUR OWN DISCRETION AND RISK, AND YOU
WILL BE SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR IT.

19. Miscellaneous

These Terms apply to the maximum extent permitted by law. In case some
provisions of these Terms will be deemed to be enforceable or invalid by the court,
it does not affect other provisions of the Contract. We shall replace the invalid
provisions with similar terms that are enforceable under relevant law and derive
from the nature of the whole Contract.

These Terms have been formed in English language, which shall prevail to any
other possible language versions of these Terms that we may publish on our Site
for informative purposes. English is also a communication language between you
and Flourish. We may, but are not obligated to communicate with you in any
other language that you possess.

20. Enabled payment methods and payment process description

You can subscribe to the Flourish - Smart Employee Growth Assistant with the
payment cards that support payment via the Internet: VISA, Maestro or MasterCar.
Payment by card was realized in cooperation with AllSecure d.o.o. and NLB Banka
a.d. Podgorica, and it is done in a safe and certified way through the AllSecure
Payment Gateway, by simply entering data from a payment card.



At any time of using the system, the user is offered the option of paying the bill on
an annual basis. On the landing page itself, you can immediately select the range
of users. When the end of the trial period approaches, the company is notified via
email, which has a link to a page where the user enters card information and pay
for the product on an annual basis.

After the end of the trial period, the annual subscription will start, whereby the
calculation is made at the beginning of the calculation period, in advance, for the
current number of users. If, during the annual subscription, the number of users
changes and the package is increased, a new charge is initiated and the new
annual subscription starts from that moment.

On the other hand, if the company does not enter the card data by the end of the
trial period, after the first login to billing, the administrator has the option to enter
the card data.

The payment goes from the primary card, and if there is a problem with it, the
system switches to other cards if they are entered. If the company has only one
card, and there is a problem with billing through it, the company's admin is
informed about the problem via mail notification.

21. Applied standards and processes in data protection when paying by card

When entering payment card data, confidential information is transmitted via a
public network in a protected (encrypted) form using the SSL protocol, using the
most modern methods of tokenization of sensitive data, and in accordance with
PCI-DSS standards. Payment card information is never available to the merchant.

3D Secure protection for all merchants and customers - AllSecure Payment
Gateway uses the highest global standards of data protection and privacy. All
merchants using the AllSecure Payment Gateway are automatically included in
the 3D-Secure protection, guaranteeing customers the security of their
purchases. Customers' payment card numbers are not stored on the merchant's
system, and the registration itself is protected by SSL data encryption.

PCI DSS Standards - AllSecure Payment Gateway constantly complies with all
requirements of card organizations in order to increase the security level of
merchants and customers. From 2005 to today, without interruption, the system
has been certified as PCI-DSS Level 1, which represents the highest standard in the
industry. PCI Data Security Standard (PCI-DSS) is a norm that defines the
necessary security measures for processing, storing and transmitting sensitive



card data. PCI Standards protect sensitive data about the cardholder during the
entire payment process: from the moment of data entry at the merchant's point of
sale, during communications between the merchant and relevant banks and card
organizations, as well as later storage of that data.

22. How are refunds made in the case of card payments?

In the event that you have subscribed to use the Flourish Smart Employee Growth
Assistant, but during the trial period you decide that you do not want to use it, you
can cancel your subscription at any time, and given that you do not have to enter
your card details during this period, there is no need to refund. In the event that
you have purchased a subscription to use the system and have started using it,
you may cancel your subscription at any time, but you may not request a refund.

In the event that the system does not work properly in any way, you can request a
refund. The money will be refunded in the same way you paid.

Flourish is obliged to refund money exclusively via the same VISA, Maestro or
MasterCard card that was used for payment. This means that our bank will refund
the funds to the cardholder's account at our request. To request a refund please
contact us at info@flourishapp.me. If you are eligible for a return, we will refund
you within 5 business days.

23. Statement of Conversion

All payments will be made in Euros (EUR). If payment is made with payment cards
issued by foreign Banks, the Euro amount of the transaction will be converted into
the Bank's settlement currency (EUR) according to the exchange rate of the
Central Bank of Montenegro. When debiting the payment card used to pay for the
service, the already converted amount will be converted into the local currency,
according to the exchange rate applied by the payment card operators.

24. Description of the method of registration / tokenization of card data

AllSecure Vault is a PCI-DSS compliant payment card data store. AllSecure
replaces such data from the card, which are securely stored, with a token that is
used for every subsequent purchase, so there is no need to re-enter previously
saved data.

During the initial payment, the data from the payment card is registered and
stored on certified systems, and in return tokens are sent that represent a
"replacement" for sensitive card data that merchants are not allowed to have.



Tokens are generated as a random string of numbers that cannot be converted
into card data by anyone who is not authorized to do so. Storing this data enables
easier and faster recurring transactions, and facilitates the purchase process.
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